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1. Mayor Bobby Watkins calls the meeting to order.  

 

2. Jessica Green, City Clerk calls roll. Bobby Watkins-present, Tommy Walker-present, Connie Poole-

present, Jason Wagnon-present, Daulfin Bennett-present.   

 

3. CONSIDER AND ACT TO ADOPT A PROCLAMATION FOR COVID-19 PRECAUTIONS AND 

PREPARATIONS. 

Mayor Watkins states, a state of emergency exists within the city limits of Krebs, Pittsburg 
County, Oklahoma. This order shall take effect on March 26, 2020 at 12:01 a.m. and shall 
terminate on April 9, 2020 at 11:59 p.m. unless otherwise acted on by Krebs City Council. A state 
of emergency exists within the city limits of Krebs, Pittsburg County, Oklahoma. This 
Proclamation shall become effective at 12:01 a.m. March 26, 2020. The public facilities of the City 
of Krebs are closed to the public until April 2, 2020 or otherwise extended by the mayor. 
Restaurants, bars, businesses, and privately-owned gathering places are highly recommended to 
ensure at least six (6) feet of space for each patron, per CDC recommendations.  All businesses 
within the City of Krebs are highly recommended to ensure at least six (6) feet of space for each 
patron and only 10 people within the business at a time. As per recommendation from Governor 
of the State of Oklahoma, businesses will be open for drive-thru, carry-out, and delivery services 
only.  All bars, breweries, and other establishments that sell liquor or beer by the drink are 
closed. All gyms, fitness centers, recreation centers, and other similar facilities will be closed. 
This proclamation does not prohibit an employee, contractor, vendor, or supplier of a place of 
public accommodation from entering, existing, using, or occupying that place of public 
accommodation in their professional capacity. The restrictions imposed by this order do not 
apply to any of the following: Places for public accommodation that offer food and beverage not 
for on-premises consumption, including grocery stores, markets, convenience stores, dispensary, 
and food pantries, other than those portions of the place of public accommodation subject to the 
requirements of the section; Crisis shelters or similar institutions. For purposes of this order, 
“place of public accommodation” means a business, or an educational, refreshment, 
entertainment, or recreation facility, or an institution of any kind, whether licensed or not, 
whose goods, services, facilities, privileges, advantages, or accommodations are extended, 



 

 

offered, sold, or otherwise made available to the public. This order does not alter any of the 
obligations under the law of an employer affected by this order to its employees or the 
employees of another employer. Mayor Watkins stated that this is going to get worse. Daulfin 
Bennett states that Pittsburg County is not under the “dine in and carryout”. Tommy Walker 
states that there is a proclamation that states that we should close. Mayor Watkins asks for a 
motion. Connie Poole makes the motion. Tommy Walker seconds the motion. Mayor Watkins 
calls for a vote. Tommy Walker-yes, Connie Poole-yes, Jason Wagnon-yes, Daulfin Bennett-no. 
Motion passes.  

 

4. COMMENTS FROM THE COUNCIL AND MAYOR  

None 

 

5. ADJOURN 

Mayor Watkins asks for a motion to adjourn. Tommy Walker makes the motion. Jason Wagnon 

seconds the motion. Mayor Watkins calls for a vote. Tommy Walker-yes, Connie Poole-yes, Jason 

Wagnon-yes, Daulfin Bennett-yes. Motion to adjourn passes.  

  
 


